
Ravensfield Gardens, Stoneleigh



Guide Price £720,000

• *** GUIDE PRICE £700,000 to £725,000

***

• Block Paved Driveway + Attached Garage

• Attractive and Stylish Semi Detached House

• Living Room With Wood Burning Stove

• Dining Area With Bi-Folding Doors

• Fully Fitted Kitchen With Granite Worktops

• Utility/Boot Room With Door To Garden

• Three Double Bedrooms + Loft/Hobbies Room

• Spacious Family Bathroom

• Well Established Rear Garden

Freehold

*** GUIDE PRICE £700,000 to £725,000 ***

A beautifully appointed three bedroom semi detached house
with driveway, attached garage and well established level rear
garden offering further potential for extension and situated in
one of Stoneleigh's sought after residential roads. 

With its attractive appearance and desirable location this home
is beautifully presented with a modern and stylish feel
throughout.

You approach the property via a light grey block paved driveway
which provides ample off road parking and leads to an attached
garage which is currently used as a home gym and offers further
potential for conversion and extension subject to planning
consent. 

Upon entering the home you are greeted by a welcoming
entrance hall with stairs to the first floor landing and two large

under stairs storage cupboards. From here a door leads through
to a bright and spacious living room with engineered oak
flooring, a double glazed window to the front aspect with
bespoke window shutters and a wood burning stove. There is a
separate dining area with bi-folding doors which flood the room
with natural light and lead out to the rear garden. 

The kitchen has been fitted with a tasteful range of floor and
wall mounted white units with black granite worktops and space
for appliances. There is an adjoining utility/boot room which
provides a variety of uses and handy access to both the garage
and garden via two further doors. 

Upstairs there are three good sized bedrooms, all with double
glazed windows; and radiators, along with a luxurious family
bathroom with a matching contemporary suite. The loft is fully
boarded with a skylight window, power and lighting. 

A particular feature is the well established and secluded rear

garden, a peaceful space to relax and enjoy with lots of
potential for a home office or garden studio. A paved patio
terrace spans the width of the property and there is a handy
storage shed.

Stoneleigh is a highly sought after residential area with a
bustling broadway of shops and restaurants at its heart, as well
as a mainline railway station with services to Waterloo every
twenty minutes. There is a choice of infant and junior schools
within the immediate vicinity and the historic Nonsuch Park runs
alongside the south east side. 

Both the M25 and A3 are easily accessible giving a straight
forward route to London and both Heathrow and Gatwick
international airports.

Freehold










